Bid Tabulation
Columbia County, Florida
Board of County Commissioners

Date: 06/02/2021
Bid No: 2021-E

Project: Residential, Commercial, and Industrial

Solid Waste Services

FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC

Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.

GFL Solid Waste Southeast, LLC

OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 1 OPTION 2

With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts With Carts Without Carts
Regular Resident S 17.44 | $ 15.73 | $ 17.44 | S 15.73 | $ 11.71 | $ 8.98 S 11.81 | $ 9.08 | $ 15.00 | $ 12.76 | $ 15.00 | $ 13.32
Backdoor Resident S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 20.00 | $ 2248 | S 19.75] S 22.58 | $ 19.85] S 15.00 | $ 12.76 | $ 15.00 | $ 13.32
Second Pickup S 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.10 | $ 35.10 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00
Reycling S 518 [ $ 5.18 1S 518 [ $ 5.181$ 459 [ $ 459 1S 469 [ $ 4.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Yard Trash $ 466 | S 466 | s 4.66 | $ 4.66 | $ - [$ il - IS - 1s 5.10 | $ 5.10 | $ 5.10 | $ 5.10
Bulk Yard Debris S 13.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 25.00 [ $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00

This bid tabulation is a summary of the residential solid waste collection.
All items are listed at a cost per month.

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off Containers
OPTION 2: Residential Solide Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY































2021-E Solid Waste Services

CERTIFICATION

Sealed bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia
County, 135 NE Hernando Avenue, Room 203, Lake City, FL, 32055 no later than 2:00 P.M., on
June 2, 2021. Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to accept the
bid in the county's best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

I certify that this bid meets or exceeds the County specifications and that the undersigned bidder
declares that I have carefully examined the solicitation documents, term and conditions of this
bid, and I am thoroughly familiar with its provisions. The undersigned bidder further declares
that he/she has not divulged, discussed or compared his bid with any other bidders and has not
colluded with any other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

By signing below, the submission shall be deemed a representation and certification by the

Contractor that you have investigated all aspects of the solicitation, have read and understand the
solicitation, and acknowledge all addenda.

COMPANY: FCC Environmental Services Florida, LLC paTE. 05/28/2021

ADDRESS: 5840 Corporate Way, Suite 250, West Palm Beach, FL 33407

PHONE NO: (832) 404-2597

EMAIL: dan.t\rnq;l@P{\noh‘r;rnnmnnfnl fa¥aSas)

SIGNATURE: _

PRINT NAME/TITLE: Dan Brazul / vice rresiaent of Collection Operations




FCC provides Bid Bonds with an actual dollar amount based on the project to ensure there is no confusion of
the “5% of the first © 1r's annual Residential Contract amount”, that is specified in the bid specs.

For this project, we have summed the annual amounts of the system-wide services (regular resident, recycling
ond yard trash) for the most expensive scenario proposed (solid waste collected with carts) .

- Regular Resident: $4,653,550.08

- Recycling: $1,382,189.76

- Yard Trash: $1,243,437.12

- TOTAL: $7,279,176.96

- Minimum BID BOND amount (5% of the total): $363,958.85

To ensure that FCC’ Bid Bond covers the 5% of the first year’s annual Residential Contract amount, our Bid
Bond amount is $400,000.00 instead of $363,958.85.

LI I LUy, F VT UG

Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services










Aspen American Insurance Company
STATUTORY STATEMENT OF FINANCIAL CONDITION

December 31, 2019
Assets

Bonds
Common stocks
Cash and short term investments
Other invested assets
Premiums in course of collection
Amounts recoverable from reinsurers
Other assets

Total Assets

Liabllities

Reserve for losses and adjustment expenses
Commissions payable, contingent commissions and other similar charges
Unearned premiums
Ceded reinsurance premiums payable
Amounts withheld or retained by company for account of others
Payable to parent, subsidiaries and affiliates
Retroactive Reinsurance
Reserve for taxes, expenses and other liabilities
Total Liabilities

Surplus as regards policyholders

Total Surplus and Liabilities

//AMM/W

Tredsurer & CFO ~——o

State of Connecticut
County of Hartford

$ 457,121,334
183,092,685
138,712,770

41,677,152
132,534,153
58,987,053
5,705,704
$ 1,017,830,851

$ 244,423,610
2,946,564
168,488,803
59,266,471
41,197,182
9,851,008
{60,581,404)
49,860,832

515,453,066

502,377,785

$ 1,017,830,851

Kenneth Gerald Cadematori, Treasurer and CFO being duly sworn, of Aspen American Insurance Company, Texas; and that
the foregoing is a true and correct statement of financial condition of said company, as of December 31, 2019, This
unaudited financial statement is in agreement with Aspen American insurance Company's December 31, 2019 filings to the

NAIC and to the State of Texas.

Subscribed and sworn to before me, this l 7 “day of February 2020.

Al D)

Notary Public
KIM D. SLIVA

NOTARY PUBLIC
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES JUNE 80, 2021







2021-E Solid Waste Services

ATTACHMENT A
BID FORM

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2021-E for Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off
Containers

a. Curbside Service

b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

Option 1 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of | Residential
. . Extended Cost
(cost per month) service units
rRegular Resident $£8.98 12 22,236 $2,396,151.36
Backdoor Resident $19.75 Optional 12 22,236 $0.00
Second Pickup $35.00 Optional 12 22,236 $0.00
Recycling $4.59 12 22,236 | $1,224,758.08
Yard Trash $0.00 Included in Reg. Resi. 12 22,236 $0.00
Bulk Yard Debris $10.00 per yard per pick up 12 22,236 $0.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ 3,620,909.44
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2021-E

Solid Waste Services

OPTION 1
Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost
Curbside Service with . .
Contractor Supplied Carts Montl}s of Re51d§nt1al Extended Cost
service units
(cost per month)
Regular Resident $11.71 12 22,236 $3,124,602.72
Backdoor Resident $22.48 Optional 12 22,236 $0.00
Second Pickup $35.00 Optional 12 22,236 $0.00
Recycling $4.59 12 22,236 $1,224,758.08
Yard Trash $0.00 included in Reg. Resi. 12 22,236 $0.00
Bulk Yard Debris $10.00 per yard per pick up 12 22,236 $0.00

Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ 4,349,360.80

52




OPTION 1

2021-E

Solid Waste Services

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week

2 Times per week

3 Times per week

Small Commercial
(Cart corviral

$17.79

2 yard trontload
container

$49.19

N/A

N/A

$98.38

$147.57

4 yard frontload
container

$98.38

$196.76

$295.13

6 yard frontload
container

$147.57

$295.13

$442.70

8 yard frontload
container

$196.76

$393.51

$590.27

Industrial Solid Waste

Permanent Roll-Off Containers

Delivery/
Install

Rental per
month

Per Pull

Disposal

Per ton

Per cubic yard

2 yard stationary S
compactor

$400.00

$185.00

$52.00

N/A

40 yard receiver
container

$185.00

$

N/A

30 yard self-contained
compactor

$585.00

$185.00

$52.00

N/A

20 yard open top
container

$85.00

$90.00

$170.00

$52.00

30 yard open top
container

$85.00

$90.00

$170.00

$52.00

40 yard open top
container

$85.00

$100.00

$170.00

$52.00
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OPTION 1

2021-E

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Solid Waste Services

Delivery/Install Rer:i:)ﬂtﬁer Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
20 yard open top $85.00 $90.00 $170.00 $ $4.50
container
30 yard open top $85.00 $90.00 $170.00 g $4.50
container
40 yard open top $85.00 $100.00 $170.00 $ $4.50
container
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2021-E Solid Waste Services

‘ OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY
a. With carts
b. Without carts
Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of | Residential
. . Extended Cost
(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $9.08 12 22,236 | $2,422,834.56
Backdoor Resident $19.85 Optional 12 22,236 | $0.00
Second Pickup $35.10 Optional 12 22,236 $0.00
Recycling $4.69 12 22,236 | $1,251,442.08
Yard Trash $0.00 Included in Reg. Resi. 12 22,236 | $0.00
1‘ Bulk Yard Debris $10.00 per yard per pickup 12 22,236 $0.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts § 3,674,276.64
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2021-E Solid Waste Services

OPTION 2
Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost
Curbside Service with . .
Contractor Supplied Carts Months of Re51d§nt1al Extended Cost
service units
(cost per month)
Regular Resident $11.81 12 22,236 | $3,151,285.92
Backdoor Resident $22.58 Optional 12 22,236 | $0.00
Second Pickup $35.10 Optional 12 22,236 | $0.00
Recycling $4.69 12 22,236 | $1,251,442.08
Yard Trash $0.00 Included in Reg. Resi. 12 22,236 $0.00
Bulk Yard Debris $$10.00 per yard per pickup 12 22,236 $0.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ 4,402,728.00
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OPTION 2

2021-E

Solid Waste Services

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week

2 Times per week

3 Times per week

Small Commercial

{rart cpﬂ/ir‘p\ S 1779 N/A N/A
£ yard trontioad $49.19 $98.38 $147.57
container

4 yard frontload $98.38 $196.76 $29513
contamner

6 yard frontload $147 57 $295.13 $442.70
container

8 yard frontload $196.76 $393 51 $590.27
container

o7




2021-E Solid Waste Services
COUNTY SERVICES
Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost
Location Name Location Address Conta;?zeer/Cart Cost per pickup l:)i:rk:‘:&) Vg:::fisczf Extended Cost

Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln. Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 2 52 $4,725.76
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 1 52 $2362.88
Bethlehem Community Center 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 1 52 $2362.88
Columbia County Emergency | » ¢4 1y | ake City Ave. Frontload 6 yd. | $34.08 2 52 |33544.32
Operations Center
g:(l)“mbia County Fire Station | 50 o State Road 247 Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 | $1,181.44

mbia County Fire Station 1 04 N US Highway 41 96 gal Cart $4.11 1 52 |s21372
g;’;“mbia County Fire Station | 3 1¢ G\ pinemount Hwy. 96 gal Cart $4.11 1 52 $213.72
;f;’;“mbia County Fire Station | 15595 § US Highway 441 96 gal Cart $4.11 I 52 |s21372
g’é“mb“a County Fire Station | 455 Gw Dortch St. Frontload 2 yd. | $11.36 i 52 |$59072
gfgl“mbia County Fire Station | 150 ¢p Race Track L. Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 | 8118144
g;’(l)“mbia County Fire Station |} 156 \w Mershon St. 96 gal Cart $11.36 1 52 |s21372
gg}‘m‘bia County Fire Station 1} 50 Ny [ ake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $34.08 ! 52 |s21372
g‘r’a'gg;lbia County Library West | 135 Nw Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload 4 yd. | $11.36 i 52 $1181.44
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload2 yd. | $11.36 1 52 $590.72
Columbia County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6 yd. | $34.08 1 52 |s1,772.18

Office
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2021-E Solid Waste Services
coumbla County Sherif’s 347 Business Point Dr. Frontload 2 yd. | $11.36 I 52 |s$500.72
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 5 52 $11,814.40
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload 2 yd. | $11.36 1 52 $590.72
EZL“;‘E"“ County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 5 52 |$11.814.40
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload 2 yd. | $11.36 1 52 $590.72
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 $1,181.44
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 $1,181.44
- ardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln. Frontload 2 yd. | $11,36 1 52 $590.72
«um Island Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr. Frontload 8 yd. | $45.44 1 52 $2,362.88
g‘(’)‘r’;};ﬁﬂ;‘“&i P White 17579 SW SR 47 Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 [$1,181.44
Springville Community Center 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 $1,181.44
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload 2 yd. | $11.72 1 52 $590.72
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload 2 yd. | $11.72 1 52 $590.72
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 $1,181.44
Hinfield Community Center and | 1377 Nw Winfield st. Frontload 4 yd. | $22.72 1 52 [$1,181.44

59

Total County Services $ 57,190.44




2021-E Solid Waste Services

CERTIFICATION

Sealed bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia
County, 135 NE Hermando Avenue, Room 203, Lake City, FL, 32055 no later than 2:00 P.M., on
June 2, 2021. Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to accept the
bid in the county's best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

I certify that this bid meets or exceeds the County specifications and that the undersi_ d bidder
declares that I have carefully examined the solicitation documents, term and conditions of this
bid, and I am thoroughly familiar with its provisions. The undersigned bidder further declares
that he/she has not divulged, discussed or compared his bid with any other bidders and has not
colluded with any other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

By signing below, the submission shall be deemed a representation and certification by the

Contractor that you have investigated all aspects of the solicitation, have read and understand the
solicitation, and acknowledge all addenda.

COMPANY: Waste Pro of Florida, Inc. DATE: June 2, 2021

ADDRESS: 401 NW Waldo Street, Lake City, Florida, 32055

PHONE NO: (386) 758-7800

EMAIL: bwintjien@wasteprousa.com

SIGNATURE:

PRINT NAME/TITLE: Brian Wintjen, Regional Vice President




Document A310™ - 2010

Conforms with The American Institute of Architects AIA Document 310

Bid Bond

CONTRACTOR: SURETY:
(Name, legal status and address) (Name, legal status and principal place of business)
Waste Pro of Florida, Inc. RLI Insurance Company
401 NW Waldo Street 9025 N. Lindbergh Drive This document has important
Lake City, FL 32055 Peoria, IL 61615 leor  ces. Consultation
Mailing Address for Notices witn an anorney is encouraged
with respect to its completion or
OWNER: modification.
(Name, legal status and address) Any singular reference to
i iei Contractor, Surety, Owner or
Columbia County Board of County Commissioners other party shall bé considered
135 NE Hernando Ave. plural where applicable.
Lake City, FL 32055
BOND AMOUNT: 5% Five Percent of the first year's annual Residential Contract amount

PROJECT:

(Name, location or address. and Project number, if any)

BID NO. 2021-E - Residential, Commercial and Industrial Solid Waste Services

The Contractor and Surety are bound to the Owner in the amount sct forth above, for the payment of which the Contractor and Surcty bind
themselves, their heirs, exceutors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, as provided herein. The conditions of this
Bond arc such that if the Owner aceepts the bid of the Contractor within the time specified in the bid documents, or within such time period
as may be agreed to by the Owner and Contractor, and the Contractor either (1) enters into a contract with the Owner in accordance with
the terms of such bid, and gives such bond or bonds as may be specified in the bidding or Contract Documents, with a surety admitted in
the jurisdiction of the P’roject and otherwise acceptable to the Owner, for the faithful performance of such Contract and for the prompt
payment of labor and material furnished in the prosecution thereof: or (2) pays to the Owner the ditterence, not to exceed the amount of
this Bond, between the amount specificd in said bid and such larger amount for which the Owner may in good faith contract with another
party to perform the work covered by said bid, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in [ull force and eflect. The
Surety hereby waives any notice of an agreement between the Owner and Contractor to extend the time in which the Owner may accept the
bid. Waiver ol notice by the Surety shall not apply to any extension exceeding sixty (60) days in the aggregate beyond the time for
acceplance of bids specilied in the bid documents, and the Owner and Contractor shall obtain the Surety's consent for an extension bevand
sixty (60) days.

If this Bond is issued in connection with a subcontractor’s bid to a Contractor, the term Contractor in this Bond s
Subcontractor and the term Owner shall be deemed to be Contractor.

When this Bond has been fumished to comply with a statutory or other legal requirement in the location of the P
this Bond conflicting with said statutory or legal requirement shall be deemed deleted herefrom and provisions ¢
statutory or other legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated herein. When so fumished, the intentis that th
as a statutory bond and not as a common law bond.

Signed and scaled this ~ 2nd day of June, 2021.

Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.

I

(Timess Chaun M. Wilson P QRAL

: i
L
5 -

S-0054/AS 810
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P: (800)645-2402 E: support@rlicorp.com

RLI® P.O. BOX 3967 PEORIA, IL 61512‘3967 RL' |nsurance Company

SURETY RLISURETY.COM December 31, 2020
Admitted Assets Liabilities and Surplus
Investments: Liabilities:
Fixed maturities. . .. .. ... ... ... ... . .. ... .. .. $ 941654491 Reserve for unpaid losses and loss
Equity securities . .. ... L L 1.122.236.300 adjustment expenses . ... ... ... ... ... $ 686,262614
Short-term investments. . 0 Unearned premiums. ... ... ... ..., 277.750.198
Realestate . . ... ....... ... . ... ... ... ....... 30.947.050 Accrued expenses .. ... ... 72.969,006
Properties held to produce income .. ... ... ... ... .. 0 Fundsheld . ... ... .. ... ... ... ... ... ... ... .. 350.474
Cash on hand andondeposit ... .. .. .. . ... .. ... 47,740,062 Advance premiums. .. 12,334.552
Otherinvestedassets. . ... ... ... .. ... .. ... ... . .. 51.152,519 Amounts withheld ... ... .. ... o0 78.066.493
Receivables for securities. .. ... . ... .. .. .. ... .. 27,482 Remittances and items not allocated .. .. .. . .. . 2,245 962
Agents'balances. .. ... ... .. L. 86,151,757 Dividends declared and unpaid .. .. ... ... ... .. .. 28,659
Investment income due and accrued, . ... .. ... .. ... 7.413.030 Ceded reinsurance premium payable, . .. ... ... .. 23,810,949
Fundsheld . . ... ......... ... ... ....... .. .. 0 Payable for securities, ... ............ ... ... 2,315,086
Reinsurance recoverable on paid losses . .. . ... ... . 20.970.446 Statutory penalties . ... .. .. ... ... .. ... 289,600
Federal income taxes receivable .. .. . ... . ... ... 399,789 Current federal & foreign income taxes ... ... .. ... 0
Net deferred tax asset. .. ... ... .. .. .. ... .. .. ... . 0 Federal income tax payable . ., . ... ... .. . .. ... 10,763.540
Guarantee funds receivable or on deposit .. ... ... . . .. . 39,285 Borrowed money and accrued interest. ... 0
Electronic data processing equipment, Drafts outstanding ... ... . .. ... .. . ... ... 0
net of depreciation . .. .. ... ... ... ... 608,401 Payable to affiiate. . ... ... ... ... ... 15,714,222
Receivable from affiliates . .. ... .. . ... ... ... . .. .. 2,556,493 Other liabilities 9,843,395
Other admitted assets. .. ... ... ... ... ..... .. .. 2,439,639
- Total Liabilities ... . $ 1.192,744.750
Total Admitted Assets $ 2.314,336,744 -
- Surplus:
Commonstock .. ... ... ... .. ... ... $ 10,000.375
Additional paid-in capital .. ... ... ... . .. .. ... 242 451,084
Unassigned surplus . ... ... 869,140,535
State of lllinois —_—
Total Surplus $ 1.121.591,994
County of Peoria
Total Liabilities and Surplus $ 2314336744

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says: That he is the President of RLI Insurance Company; that said Company is a
corporation duly organized, in the State of ifiinois, and licensed and engaged in business in the State of _Florida

and has duly complied with all the requirements of the laws of said State applicable of
said Company and is duly qualified to act as Surety under such laws: that said Company has also complied with and is duly
qualified to act as Surety under the Act of Congress approved July 1947, 6U.S.C sec. 6-13; and that to the best of his
knowledge and belief the above statement is a full, true, and correct statement of the financial condition of the said
Company on the 31st day of December 2020.

s \‘“unmu,l,’
SNRNCE co, ‘ (Eﬁﬁ: -
.SQ .- 456 AMUG

Attest:

\\‘\\

K 71::,: Corporate Craig Klietherr‘nesfi ] President
£ Seal
e % &:\5\%&/
} Olga S. Happel VAdsistant Secretary

CATHERINE D. GLOVER .

OFFICIAL SEAL .
Notarial M»x C-Mi}-
March 24, 2024

Seal
Affixed Catherine D. Glover Notary Public, State of lllinois

MO0058321
62




2021-E

Solid Waste Services

ATTACHMENT A

BID FORM

The undersigned, having carefully read and considered the instructions to propose for Bid No.
2021-E for Residential, Commercial, and Industrial Solid Waste Services, for Columbia County,
Florida, does hereby offer to perform such services on behalf of the County, of the type and
quality in the manner described, and subject to and in accordance with the terms and conditions
set forth in the Agreement documents at the rates, expressed in figures hereinafter set forth:

OPTION 1: Residential Solid Waste, Commercial Solid Waste, Industrial Solid Waste
Permanent Roll-Off Containers, and Construction and Demolition Waste Temporary Roll-Off

Containers

a. Curbside Service
b. Curbside Service with Contractor Supplied Carts

Option I shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units

= Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of | Residential
) ) Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 12.76 12 22,236 3,404,776.32
Backdoor Resident $ 12 76 12 22.236 3,404,776.32
Second Pickup $ 10.00 12 22,236 2,668,320.00
Recycling $ No Bid 12 22.236 No Bid
Yard Trash $ 510 12 22,236 1,360.844.00
Bulk Yard Debri $ 12 22,236 6,670,800.00

u ard Debris 25 00
Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts$ __ 12.76

*Backdoor residents per the RFP indicates only 8.
**Regular Residential Rate reflects residential trash and minimus amounts of yard trash.




2021-E Solid Waste Services

OPTION 1
Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost
Curbside Service with . .
Contractor Supplied Carts Months of Re51d§n‘ual Extended Cost
service units
(cost per month)
Regular Resident $ 15.00 12 22236 | $  4,002,480.00
Backdoor Resident $ 15.00 12 22,236 $ 400248000
Second Pickup $ 10.00 12 22236 |$  2668,320.00
Recycling $ No Bid 12 22236 |3  No Bid
Yard Trash $ 510 12 22236 |'$  1360,844.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ 25.00 12 22236 |$ 6,670,800.00
Total OPTION 1 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $ 15.00

~

*Backdoor residents per the RFP indicates only 8.
**Regular Residential Rate reflects residential trash and minimus amounts of yard trash.




2021-E

Solid Waste Services

OPTION 1
Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal
1 Time per week 2 Times per week 3 Times per week

Small Commercial

(qufieﬂ[;{‘p‘ $ 2500 N/A N/A

2 yard frontload 50.66

container $ $ 101.32 $ 151.98

4 yard frontload $ 101.32 § 20264 $ 303.97

container

6 yard frontload $ 151.98 $ 303.97 $ 45595

container

8 yard frontload $  202.64 § 405.29 § 607.93

container

Industrial Solid Waste

Permanent Roll-Off Containers

Delivery/ Rental per )
Install month Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard

2 yard stationary
compactor $ 500.00 $ 385.00 $ 250.00 $ 52.00 N/A
40 ya‘rd receiver $ 500.00 ¢ 425.00 $ 450.00 $ 52.00 N/A
container
30 yard self-contained $ 500.00 $ 400.00 $ 450.00 $ 52.00 N/A
compactor
20 yard open top 0
container $ $ 50.00 $ 450.00 $ 52.00 $ 4.50
30 yard open top $ 0 $ 50.00 $ 450.00 $ 52.00 $ 4.50
container
40 yard open top 0
container $ $ 50.00 $ 450.00 $ 52.00 $ 4.50




OPTION 1

2021-E

Construction and Demolition Waste
Temporary Roll-Off Containers

Solid Waste Services

Delivery/Install Rigii: tEer Per Pull Disposal
Per ton Per cubic yard
20 yard open top $ 0 $ 50 § 450.00 $ 0 $ 4.50
container
30 ya.rd open top $ 0 $ 50 ¢ 450.00 ¢ O $ 4.50
container
40yard opentop g g § 50 §450.00 |§ O $ 4.50
container




2021-E Solid Waste Services

OPTION 2: Residential Solid Waste and Commercial Solid Waste ONLY
a. With carts
b. Without carts

Option 2 shall include County services. See list below.

Residential Solid Waste Collection

Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Curbside Service Months of | Residential
. . Extended Cost

(cost per month) service units
Regular Resident $ 13.32 12 22236 | $ 3554202.24
Backdoor Resident $ 13.32 12 22,236 | $ 3,554,202.24
Second Pickup $ 10.00 12 22,236 | $ 2,668,320.00
Recycling $ No Bid 12 22,236 |'$ No Bid
Yard Trash $ 510 12 22,236 | $ 1,360,844
Bulk Yard Debris $ 2500 12 22,236 | $ 6,670,800.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITHOUT Carts $ 13.32

*Backdoor residents per the RFP indicates only 8.
**Regular Residential Rate reflects residential trash and minimus amounts of yard trash.
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Monthly Cost X Months X Residential Units = Extended Cost

Solid Waste Services

Curbside Service with ) .
Contractor Supplied Carts MZ?theOf Re51d§:tnt1al Extended Cost
(cost per month) Serv unis
Regular Resident $ 1500 12 22,236 | $ 4,002,480.00
Backdoor Resident $ 15.00 12 22.236 $ 4,002,480.00
Second Pickup $ 10.00 12 22.236 $ 2,668,320.00
Recycling $ No Bid 12 22236 | $ No Bid
Yard Trash $ 510 12 22.236 $ 1,360,844.00
Bulk Yard Debris $ 25.00 12 22.236 $ 6,670,800.00

Total OPTION 2 Residential Solid Waste Collection WITH Carts $

15.00

*Backdoor residents per the RFP indicates only 8.
**Regular Residential Rate reflects residential trash and minimus amounts of yard trash.
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Solid Waste Services

Commercial Solid Waste Collection and Disposal

1 Time per week

2 Times per week

3 Times per week

Small Commercial

container

&*arf qgwipp\ B $ 25.00 B L N/A N/A
2 yard frontioad S 50.66 § 10132 § 151.98
container
4 yard frontload
container $ 101.32 $ 20264 $ 303.97
6 yard frontload
container $ 151.98 $ 30397 $ 455.95
8 yard frontload $ 202.64 § 405.29 5 60793
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COUNTY SERVICES

Cost per pickup X Pickup(s) per Week X Weeks of Service = Extended Cost

Location Name Location Address Conta;lil::/Cart Cost per pickup l;lcrk:zfj() \’;’:::](isc:f Extended Cost

Animal Shelter 1392 NW Shelter Gln. Frontload 8yd. | $ 46.80 2 52 4,867.20
Annie Mattox Park 537 NE Center Ave Frontload 8 yd. | $ 46.80 1 52 2,433.60
Bethlehem Community Center 835 SE Bethlehem Ave. Frontload8yd. | $ 46.80 1 52 2,433.60
g‘;L‘;';?giscé’::grEmergency 263 NW Lake City Ave. Frontload 6yd. | $  35.10 2 52 3,650.40
g:éumbia County Fire Station 508 SW State Road 247 Frontload 4yd. | $ 23.40 1 52 1,216.80
Cojumbia County Fire SKion | 7564 NW US Highway 41 96 gal Cart $ 10.00 1 52 520.00
g;);umbia County Fire Station 2318 SW Pinemount Hwy. 96 gal Cart $ 10.00 1 52 520.00
gj;“mbia County Fire Station | | »595 § US Highway 441 96 gal Cart $ 10.00 1 52 520.00
#C;)6lumbia County Fire Station | oo o\ oo st Frontload2yd. |$ 11.70 I 52 608.40
gz)éumbia County Fire Station 370 SE Race Track Ln. Frontload 4yd. | $ 23 40 1 52 1,216.80
g;)(l)umbia County Fire Station 1456 NW Mershon St. 96 gal Cart s 10.00 1 52 520.00
Colum - County Fire SON | 579 Nw Lake Jeffery Rd. 96 gal Cart $ 10.00 ! 52 520.00
g(r)iﬁrcr;lbia County Library West 435 NW Hall of Fame Dr. Frontload4yd. |$ 23.40 I 52 1,216.80
Columbia County Main Library | 308 NW Columbia Ave. Frontload2yd. |$ 11.70 1 52 608.40
Columbia County Sheriff’s 4917 E US Highway 90 Frontload 6 yd. | $ 35.10 | 52 $ 3,650.40

Office
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‘ g‘;}l‘g;’zisbcsot‘;‘itoyns}‘e”m 347 Business Point Dr. Frontlad2yd. |$ 11.70 1 52 $ 608.40
Courthouse Annex 135 NE Hernando Ave. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 46.80 5 52 $ 12,168.00
Deep Creek Community Center | 11934 N US Highway 441 Frontload2yd. |$ 11.70 1 52 $ 608.40
gzl']‘t‘;‘:bia County Detention 389 NW Quinten St. Frontload 8 yd. | $ 46 .80 5 52 |$ 12,168.00
Guardian ad Litem 885 SW Sister Welcome Rd. Frontload2yd. |$ 11.70 I 52 $ 608.40
Lulu Community Center 205 SW Community Ct. Frontload4yd. | $ 23.40 1 52 $ 1,216.80
Mason City Community Center | 11110 S US Highway 441 Frontload4yd. | $ 23.40 1 52 $ 1,216.80
Richardson Community Center | 255 NE Coach Anders Ln. Frontload2yd. |$ 11.70 1 52 $ 608.40
Rum Island Park 1614 SW Rum Island Terr. Frontload 8yd. | $ 46.80 1 52 $ 2,433.60
g%ﬁt;ﬁg}?ymcb;titr White 17579 SW SR 47 Frontload 4yd. | $ 23 40 ! 52 |$1,216.80
Springville Community Center | 3710 NW Suwannee Valley Rd. Frontload 4yd. | $ 23.40 1 52 $ 1,216.80
Supervisors of Elections 1701 E Duval St. Frontload2yd. | $ 11.70 1 52 $ 608.40
Watertown Lake 622 NE Williams St. Frontload2yd. {$ 11.70 1 52 $ 608.40
Westside Community Center 431 SW Birley Ave. Frontload4yd. | $ 23.40 1 52 $ 1,216.80
}\i\;icnrf;z:iciogg)ln;n::anity Center and 1327 NW Winfield St. Frontload4yd. | $ 23.40 ] 52 $1,216.80

Total County Services § _62,223.20
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CERTIFICATION

Sealed bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia
County, 135 NE Hernando Avenue, Room 203, Lake City, FL, 32055 no later than 2:00 P.M., on
June 2, 2021. Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids and to accept the
bid in the county's best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

I certify that this bid meets or exceeds the County specifications and that the undersigned bidder
declares that I have carefully examined the solicitation documents, term and conditions of this
bid, and I am thoroughly familiar with its provisions. The undersigned bidder further declares
that he/she has not divulged, discussed or compared his bid with any other bidders and has not
colluded with any other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

By signing below, the submission shall be deemed a representation and certification by the

Contractor that you have investigated all aspects of the solicitation, have read and understand the
solicitation, and acknowledge all addenda.

COMPANY: GFL Solid Waste Southeast, LLC DATE: June 1, 2021

ADDRESS: 3301 Benson Drive Suite 601 Raleigh, NC 27609

PHONE NO: _904-424-5146

EMAIL: todd.strong@gflenv.com

SIGNATURE: ___

PRINTNAME/TT . e oo ooy oy der
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